
$1,037,000 - 650 Shore Drive, Bedford
MLS® #202315862 

$1,037,000
4 Bedroom, 3.00 Bathroom, 3,500 sqft
Residential on 0.29 Acres

20-C, Bedford, NS

This beautifully presented home is nestled in
the prestigious area of Bedford, close to the
picturesque waterfront including the private
marina.  When entering this fabulous home-
you are greeted with the bright spacious family
room and living area; a warm, inviting place to
gather and entertain. The kitchen, with plenty
of cabinetry, is ready for the â€œculinary
artistâ€• to present the cuisine in the formal
charming dining room. A large wood deck is off
to the side of the dining area; the perfect spot
for barbeques and outdoor fun. On the main
level, its primary bedroom offers the
convenience of a large walk-in closet and a
contemporary full ensuite, great area to relax
and unwind after along day.  . The upper level
offers another spacious bedroom with a
walk-in closet. Or rest in comfort in two more
sizeable bedrooms designed with built-in
closets.   This level has an elegant modern full
bath. The lower level is complete with an office
and plenty of storage.   Loft above garage can
be used as a 5th bedroom, media or family
room.  A full-size garage keeps vehicles and
equipment safe and secure all year. Living
here, this home is secluded by the mature
treed lot and the quiet beauty of nature.  All of
this and yet is only minutes from convenient
shopping, parks and schools.

Built in 1965

Essential Information



MLS® # 202315862

Price $1,037,000

Bedrooms 4

Bathrooms 3.00

Full Baths 2

Half Baths 2

Square Footage 3,500

Acres 0.29

Year Built 1965

Type Residential

Sub-Type Single Family Residence

Status Closed

Date Sold May 21st, 2024

Community Information

Address 650 Shore Drive

Area Halifax - Dartmouth

District 20-Bedford

Sub-District 20-C

City Bedford

County Halifax

Province NS

Postal Code B4A 2E1

Amenities

Utilities Electric, Cable Connected, Electricity Connected, Phone Connected

Parking Spaces 4

Parking Attached, Double, Paved

# of Garages 2

Interior

Interior Features Ensuite Bath, High Speed Internet

Appliances Stove, Dishwasher, Dryer, Washer, Refrigerator

Heating Baseboard, Ductless, Hot Water

Fireplace Yes

Fireplaces Propane

# of Stories 2

Stories 2 Storey

Has Basement Yes



Basement Full, Partially Finished

Exterior

Lot Description Under 0.5 Acres, Landscaped

Roof Asphalt

Construction Vinyl Siding

Foundation Concrete Perimeter

School Information

Elementary Sunnyside Elementary School

Middle Rocky Lake Junior High School

High Charles P Allen High School

Additional Information

Zoning RSU

Listing Details

Listing Office RE/MAX Nova (Halifax)
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