
$279,900 - 81 Avon Street, Bible Hill
MLS® #202324933 

$279,900
3 Bedroom, 1.50 Bathroom, 1,186 sqft
Residential on 0.11 Acres

N/A, Bible Hill, NS

Discover this lovingly renovated 1.5-story gem
overflowing with character and craftsmanship.
Nestled on a peaceful dead end street, this
home is a havenâ€”featuring a welcoming
covered porch and a fantastic back deck,
perfect for gatherings and seasonal
decorating. Enjoy the quiet charm while being
a short stroll from downtown Truro. The main
floor boasts a charming kitchen with beautiful
white cabinets and marble tole counters, a
dining room (currently a bedroom), a cozy
living space, and a convenient half bath.
Upstairs, find three bedrooms and a
well-appointed bathroom, with bonus storage
in the pull down attic. The unfinished
basement offers great storage options and
laundry. The fully fenced backyard is ideal for
kids and pets. Plus, the converted garage is
now a versatile space for storage or a fun rec
room. This home offers comfort, style, and
convenience. Don't miss outâ€”come and
experience the potential and warmth of this
family home today!

Essential Information

MLS® # 202324933

Price $279,900

Bedrooms 3

Bathrooms 1.50

Full Baths 1

Half Baths 1



Square Footage 1,186

Acres 0.11

Type Residential

Sub-Type Single Family Residence

Status Closed

Date Sold February 12th, 2024

Community Information

Address 81 Avon Street

Area Northern Region

District 104-Truro/Bible Hill/Stewiacke

Sub-District N/A

City Bible Hill

County Colchester

Province NS

Postal Code B2N 4G1

Amenities

Utilities Electric, Cable Connected, Electricity Connected, Phone Connected

Parking Spaces 1

Parking Detached, Single, Gravel

# of Garages 1

Interior

Interior Features High Speed Internet

Appliances Stove, Dishwasher, Dryer, Washer, Refrigerator

Heating Forced Air, Space Heater

# of Stories 1

Stories One and One Half

Has Basement Yes

Basement Full, Unfinished

Exterior

Lot Description Under 0.5 Acres, Level

Roof Asphalt

Construction Vinyl Siding

Foundation Concrete Perimeter

Additional Information



Zoning R2

Listing Details

Listing Office Royal LePage Atlantic (Enfield)
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