
$549,900 - 128 Sherwood Street, Cole Harbour
MLS® #202416858 

$549,900
4 Bedroom, 2.50 Bathroom, 2,201 sqft
Residential on 0.15 Acres

16-A, Cole Harbour, NS

Home sweet home! welcome to this 4
bedroom 2.5 baths detached family home
located in one of the best neighborhoods in
Colby close to schools, shops and other
amenities. Recent improvements within this
year include new flooring(primary bedroom
and upstairs hallway), new hot water tank, new
kitchen windows, updated kitchen cabinets,
newer dishwasher, flooring and newer counter
tops. Open concept main floor living, formal
dining, kitchen offers a breakfast nook
overlooking a massive back deck, Upstairs
features 3 good sized bedrooms and a family
4pc bath, Primary bedroom offers a full ensuite
and a walk in closet, Lower level is a good
space with a rec room, bedroom and utility and
laundry with its own side entrance. Nicely
landscaped lot and a workshop/shed in the
back. Community mailbox is steps away. Don't
delay viewing this home as it could be the
home sweet home you've been waiting for.

Built in 1993

Essential Information

MLS® # 202416858

Price $549,900

Bedrooms 4

Bathrooms 2.50

Full Baths 2

Half Baths 1

Square Footage 2,201



Acres 0.15

Year Built 1993

Type Residential

Sub-Type Single Family Residence

Status Closed

Date Sold September 12th, 2024

Community Information

Address 128 Sherwood Street

Area Halifax - Dartmouth

District 16-Colby Area

Sub-District 16-A

City Cole Harbour

County Halifax

Province NS

Postal Code B2V 2S3

Amenities

Utilities Electric, Cable Connected, Electricity Connected, Phone Connected,
Other

Parking No Garage, Paved

Interior

Interior Features High Speed Internet

Appliances Stove, Dishwasher, Dryer, Washer, Refrigerator

Heating Baseboard

# of Stories 2

Stories 2 Storey

Has Basement Yes

Basement Full, Finished

Exterior

Lot Description Under 0.5 Acres, Cleared, Landscaped, Level

Roof Asphalt

Construction Brick, Vinyl Siding

Foundation Concrete Perimeter

School Information

Elementary Astral Drive Elementary School



Middle Astral Drive Junior High School

High Auburn Drive High School

Additional Information

Zoning R-1

Listing Details

Listing Office Sutton Group Professional Realty
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