
$599,900 - 42 Windstone Close, Bedford
MLS® #202425857 

$599,900
3 Bedroom, 3.00 Bathroom, 2,380 sqft
Residential on 0.13 Acres

20-A, Bedford, NS

This charming home is conveniently situated
near all Bedford amenities , including
buses,schools,shopping,and just a quick trip to
Halifax! This stunning home features gleaming
cherry hardwood floors throughout the main
level and staircase. The open-concept design
showcases upgraded trim and decorative
pillars that elegantly separate the living areas.
Kitchen is solid cherry wood with lots of
counterspace & breakfast bar open to dining
and living area. The 2nd level features an
extra large master suite with large window for
lots of natural lighting, full ensuite and large
walk in closet with high grade laminate floors.
You will also find full main bathroom & large
linen closet, 2 more bedrooms which both
feature double closets. The lower level is
complete with family room, laundry are and
bathroom . Also access to your single car
heated garage, large storage room . Vacant
house schedule your viewing today .

Built in 2008

Essential Information

MLS® # 202425857

Price $599,900

Bedrooms 3

Bathrooms 3.00

Full Baths 2

Half Baths 2

Square Footage 2,380



Acres 0.13

Year Built 2008

Type Residential

Sub-Type Single Family Residence

Status Closed

Date Sold December 2nd, 2024

Community Information

Address 42 Windstone Close

Area Halifax - Dartmouth

District 20-Bedford

Sub-District 20-A

City Bedford

County Halifax

Province NS

Postal Code B4A 4L4

Amenities

Utilities Electric, Cable Connected, Electricity Connected, Phone Connected

Parking Spaces 3

Parking Attached, Single, Double, Paved

# of Garages 1

Interior

Interior Features Ensuite Bath, High Speed Internet

Appliances Stove, Dishwasher, Dryer, Washer, Refrigerator

Heating Baseboard

# of Stories 2

Stories 2 Storey

Has Basement Yes

Basement Finished, Walk-Out Access

Exterior

Lot Description Under 0.5 Acres, Hardwood Bush, Landscaped, Rolling Slope, Wooded

Roof Asphalt

Construction Brick, Vinyl Siding

Foundation Concrete Perimeter

School Information



Elementary Bedford South School

Middle Rocky Lake Junior High School

High Charles P Allen High School

Additional Information

Zoning R2

Listing Details

Listing Office RE/MAX Nova (Halifax)
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