
$289,999 - 1127 Susan Drive, Beaver Bank
MLS® #202502850 

$289,999
3 Bedroom, 2.00 Bathroom, 1,072 sqft
Residential

26-B, Beaver Bank, NS

Love is in the air at 1127 Susan Drive!
Completed in 2022, this home has seen three
beautiful years filled with milestonesâ€” new
additions to the family, endless laughter, and
memories made around every corner. Now,
itâ€™s ready for its next chapter, and it might
just be the perfect match for you. This
three-bedroom, two full bathroom home is
thoughtfully designed for comfort and
convenience. The spacious primary bedroom,
complete with an ensuite, offers a cozy retreat,
while the open-concept living room with
cathedral ceilings is perfect for entertaining
and large enough to accommodate the entire
family. Whether youâ€™re a growing family or
downsizing to embrace the ease of one-level
living, this home has something for everyone.
Nestled in a quiet, safe community, 1127
Susan Drive offers peace and serenity, while
being conveniently close to everything you
need. The double car driveway ensures plenty
of space for your vehicles (or guests!), and the
included shed provides extra storage for
lifeâ€™s essentials and adventures.  Modern,
low-maintenance, and full of heart, this home
is the perfect place to start your next chapter.
Schedule a showing today and see why it
might just be love at first sight!

Built in 2022

Essential Information

MLS® # 202502850



Price $289,999

Bedrooms 3

Bathrooms 2.00

Full Baths 2

Square Footage 1,072

Year Built 2022

Type Residential

Sub-Type Mobile Home

Status Closed

Date Sold May 28th, 2025

Community Information

Address 1127 Susan Drive

Area Halifax - Dartmouth

District 26-Beaverbank, Upper Sackville

Sub-District 26-B

City Beaver Bank

County Halifax

Province NS

Postal Code B4E 1P2

Amenities

Utilities Electric, Cable Connected, Electricity Connected, Phone Connected

Parking No Garage, Gravel

Interior

Interior Features High Speed Internet

Appliances Oven, Dryer, Washer, Refrigerator

Heating Baseboard, Ductless

Basement None

Exterior

Lot Description Under 0.5 Acres, Cleared

Roof Asphalt

Construction Vinyl Siding

Foundation Other

School Information

Elementary Beaverbank - Monarch Drive Elementary School



Middle Harold T Barrett Junior High School

High Lockview High School

Additional Information

Zoning PARK

Listing Details

Listing Office RE/MAX Nova (Halifax)
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