
$649,900 - 3 Valley Road, Bedford
MLS® #202512737 

$649,900
4 Bedroom, 2.00 Bathroom, 1,910 sqft
Residential on 0.32 Acres

20-B, Bedford, NS

Welcome to Your Perfect Family Home on a
Quiet Cul-de-Sac  This cherished one-owner,
four-bedroom, two-bath split-entry home is
located on a peaceful cul-de-sac, offering a
rare blend of comfort, convenience, and
community. Nestled in a quiet neighbourhood
just a short walk to local shopping, parks, and
a recreation centre, itâ€™s the ideal setting for
families or anyone looking to enjoy a vibrant
yet relaxed lifestyle.  Step inside and youâ€™ll
find a bright and functional layout, with
spacious living areas both up and down. The
lower-level family room is warmed by an
auxiliary oil stove, creating a cozy space for
winter evenings or relaxed weekends.  The
home also features a double car garage,
providing ample room for vehicles, storage, or
a workshop setup. With just some cosmetic
updates, this pleasingly priced home is a
fantastic opportunity for the next family to put
down roots.

Built in 1990

Essential Information

MLS® # 202512737

Price $649,900

Bedrooms 4

Bathrooms 2.00

Full Baths 2

Square Footage 1,910

Acres 0.32



Year Built 1990

Type Residential

Sub-Type Single Family Residence

Status Closed

Date Sold July 15th, 2025

Community Information

Address 3 Valley Road

Area Halifax - Dartmouth

District 20-Bedford

Sub-District 20-B

City Bedford

County Halifax

Province NS

Postal Code B4A 1K6

Amenities

Utilities Cable Connected, Electricity Connected, Phone Connected

Parking Spaces 4

Parking Attached, Double, Paved

# of Garages 2

Interior

Interior Features High Speed Internet

Appliances Electric Cooktop, Oven, Dishwasher, Dryer - Electric, Washer,
Refrigerator

Heating No Heating/Cooling

Cooling No Heating/Cooling

Stories Split Entry

Has Basement Yes

Basement Full

Exterior

Lot Description Under 0.5 Acres, Landscaped, Level

Roof Asphalt

Construction Brick, Vinyl Siding

Foundation Concrete Perimeter

School Information



Elementary Basinview Drive Community School

Middle Rocky Lake Junior High School

High Charles P Allen High School

Additional Information

Zoning RSU

Listing Details

Listing Office Century 21 All Points
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