
$479,900 - 1229 Conquerall Mills Road, Conquerall Mills
MLS® #202521584 

$479,900
3 Bedroom, 2.00 Bathroom, 1,452 sqft
Residential on 1.11 Acres

C3, Conquerall Mills, NS

Welcome to Conquerall Mills, where privacy,
style, and a sought-after location all come
together in this nearly new, stunning
bungalow. With 3 bedrooms and 2 full baths,
this home is only three years old and designed
for todayâ€™s lifestyleâ€”low-maintenance,
open-concept, and filled with thoughtful details
that stand out. Inside, the feeling is bright,
fresh, and functional. The open flow between
spaces makes every day feel easy, while the
modern finishes add just the right amount of
flair. Heat-pump, center island, electric
fireplace, low-maintenance flooring, basically
brand new, every corner feels considered, and
every detail is designed to make life more
enjoyable. Set on a spacious 1.16-acre lot,
which offers privacy all around you, youâ€™ll
love the balance of quiet living with
convenience. Itâ€™s just 6 minutes to town
amenities and 10 minutes to some of the
South Shoreâ€™s best white sand beaches.
The single detached garage is perfect for
storage, while the backyard patio and BBQ
deck were made for relaxed evenings and
summer entertaining without a neighbour in
sight. If youâ€™re searching for a home that
offers privacy without being remote, style
without the stress, and that irresistible
â€œnew homeâ€• feel without waiting to
buildâ€”this is the one.

Built in 2022

Essential Information



MLS® # 202521584

Price $479,900

Bedrooms 3

Bathrooms 2.00

Full Baths 2

Square Footage 1,452

Acres 1.11

Year Built 2022

Type Residential

Sub-Type Single Family Residence

Style Bungalow

Status Closed

Date Sold September 26th, 2025

Community Information

Address 1229 Conquerall Mills Road

Area South Shore

District 405-Lunenburg County

Sub-District C3

City Conquerall Mills

County Lunenburg

Province NS

Postal Code B4V 6A5

Amenities

Utilities Electric, Cable Connected, Electricity Connected, Phone Connected

Parking Spaces 3

Parking Detached, Single, Wired, Double, Gravel, Parking Spaces(s)

# of Garages 1

Interior

Interior Features Ensuite Bath, High Speed Internet

Appliances Electric Range, Dishwasher, Dryer, Washer, Range Hood, Refrigerator

Heating Baseboard, Ductless

Cooling Ductless

Fireplace Yes

Fireplaces Electric

Basement None



Exterior

Lot Description 1 to 2.99 Acres, Partially Cleared, Landscaped, Level, Wooded

Roof Asphalt

Construction Vinyl Siding

Foundation Stone, Insulated Concrete

Additional Information

Days on Market 32

Zoning Res

Listing Details

Listing Office EXIT Realty Inter Lake
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